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{Contract Management Use only)

CONTRACT APPROVAL FORM
e 2! ol W 19 CONTRACT

TRACKING NO.

M1l

CONTRACTOR INFORMATION . b
Cra(4 -0

Name: _ CopyFax, Inc

Address:__6631 N Executive Pk Court, Suite 210 Jacksonville, F1 32216

Contractor’s Administrator Name:___ Richard Durrant Title:_ Education & Government Sales Manager
Tel#: 904-296-1600 Ext 2413 Fax: 904-296-7i11 Email: richarddurrant@copyfax.com
CONTRACT INFORMATION

Contract Name: Maintenance and Supply Agreement for Ricoh Color Copier MPC6501 Contract Value: $3,300 Est.

Brief Description: 36 month Maintenance and Supply agreement for Ricoh Color Copier MPC6501 at $.0055 per copy black and

white print and $.045 per color print,

Contract Dates : From: _1/1/13  to 12/31/16 Status: X New  Renew _ Amend# _ WA/Task Order

How Procured: _ Sole Source  Single Source  ITB ~ RFP _ RFQ __ Coop.  Other Pigeyback Contract

If Processing an Amendmnent:

Contract #: Increase Amount of Existing Contract: No Increase

New Confract Dates: to TOTAL OR AMENDMENT AMOUNT:

APPROV S PURSUANT TO NASSAU COUNTY PURCHASING POLICY, SECTION 6

Charges based on usage
Tunding Source/Acct #
45246515-546020

2. 45245524-546020
/ . 45249515-546020
3. /i {72 &2 [
Office of ManagesmEny Date
. (T /220072
County Attorney (approved as to form only) Date

Comments:

COUNTY-MANAGE FINAL SIGNATURE APPROVAL
— 3 f51/17

Ted Selbgw/, J <{ " Date

RETURN ORIGINAL(S) TO CONTRACT MANAGEMENT FOR DISTRIBUTION AS FOLLOWS:
Original: Clerk’s Services; Contractor (original or certified copy)
Copy: Department
Office of Managenent & Budget
Contract Management
Clerk Finance

Revised 9/24/2012




NASSAU COUNTY

VENDOR NAME/ADDRESS BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS pacel 1 | of| 1 |
PO Box 4000 _ _
CopyFax, Inc FERNANDINA BEACH, FLORIDA 32035-4000 0 'DEPARTMENT -
6631 N Executive Park Court, Suite 210 Buliding
sacksonvile, Florida 32216 REQUISITION Diane Griffin__AX)
REQUISTTION BY:
VENDOR NUMBER | PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER| ' PURCHASE ORDER DATE [ " PURCHASE ORDERTOTAL - - 1 [ DISCOUNT TERMS -
10/9/2012 $3,300.00
1 [36 Month Maintenance and supply 3 | 1,100.00| $3,300.00

agreement to Include ail parts, labor Account allocations based on usage

service calls & supplles except Allocations from 1/1/13 thru 9/30/13

paper and staples for a Ricoh 45246515-546020- $306.00/yr

MP6501 Color Copier & SR4030 45245524-546020- $155.00/yr

finisher stapler 45249515-546020- $400.00/yr

Approx $1,100 per vear For 2012/2013 reducing purchase order to

encumber yearly charges

Current agreement to remain in

effect untif 12/31/12 per

Richard Durrant of CopyFax

University of South Fiorida
Contract -1 o - )
5 T/b A

&

—r

Approved By

APPROVED BY: /Z/ %_/ WHITE-+FINANCE'S COPY 1 Subtotai
g M %OW-REQUISIT!ONER’S COPY Iv] Total $3,300.00
Vv / v Z




Jacksonville ¢«

6631 N Executive Park Court
Suite 210

Jacksonville, Fl. 32216
Phone; 904.296.1600

Fax: 904.296.7111

OCTOBER 2, 2012

PROPOSAL
FOR
NASSAU COUNTY
BUILDING DEPARTMENT

RICOH MP6501 COLOR COPIER $367.97
SR4030 FINISHER-STAPLER 34,95
LEASE OPTIONS
36 MONTHS @ $402.92 PER MONTH
UNIVERSITY OF SOUTH FLORIDA #9-13-G

M
36 MONTH LEASE

MAINTENANCE AND SUPPLY AGREEMENT

TO INCLUDE ALL PARTS, LABOR, SERVICE CALLS AND
SUPPLIES EXCEPT PAPER AND STAPLES AT $.0055 PER
BLACK AND WHITE PRINT AND §.045 PER COLOR PRINT.

Gainesville ¢4 St, Augustine e Daytona Beach <%

3210 $W 40th Blvd. 140 Gateway Clrcte 480 Fentress Blvd

Suite A-2 Suite 1 Suite L

Galnesville, FL 32608 St. Johns, FL 32259 Daytona Beach, FL 32114
Phone: 352.336.1771 Phone: 904.827,0178 Phone; 386,252.2292

Fax:352.3356.8151 Fax: 904.208.5105 Fax: 386.252.0920
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) 5] UNIVERSITY OF

» AWARDED BIDS e

INVITATICN TO NEGOTIATE NUMBER: S-13-G BID TITLE: - Copiers, Printers and Multi-Functional

Printers
Award To: o ' : Tot:
Bell Techlogix, Inc. ' ' - Lot I
Dell Marketing L.P. 7' Lot I

Konica Minolta Business ‘ . Lot TI
Sclutions U.S.A., Inc. ‘

Ricch Americas Corporation Lots I & II

Xerox Co’rporatioﬁ Lots T & IX




N PROPOSAL TABULATION

N TITLE: Coplers, Printers and Multi-Functional Printers

‘N NUMBER: 9-13-G

IPENING DATE: May 22, 2009

TIME

3:00 P.M.

WARDEDDATE__ Cev M, 2099
OSTING TIME/DATE
FROM__ 2P ¢ fw‘fwjﬁ’ﬁ

UNTIL: __€P73 fw‘f??j 29

/

iy

PAGE(S)

FAILURE TC EILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRESCRIBEZD IN SECTTION 120.57(3},
FLORIDA STATUTES, OR FATLURE TO POST THE BOND OR OTHER SECURITY REQUIRED™
BY 1AW WITHIN THE TIME ALLOWED FOR FILING A BOND SHALL CONSTITUTE 2 WAIVER
OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHBRPIER 120, FLORIDA STATUTIS. ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS
ACCEPTED BY TEE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATE’S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY
AND RLL ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDETIONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS ARE
REJECTED AND SHBLL HAVE NO TORCE AND EFFECT. OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED
HEREIN ARE THE ONLY QFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND
TIME. BARLL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TQ THYS SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE
HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE.

NCTICE COF BID/FROPOSALS PROTRST BONDING, BEQ_UIRMNT—- ANY PERSON WEQ FILES AN
ACTICON PROTESTING & DECISION -OR INTERDED DECISION PERTAINING TO A SOLICITATION
SEALL AT THE TIME QF FILING OF THE FCRMAL FROTEST, FOST WITH THE UNIVERSITY A
BOND PAYRBLE TO THE UNIVERSITY OF SQUTH FLORIDA IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL TC: 10
PERCENT OF THE ESTIMATED.VALUE OF THE PROTESTOR'S BID OR PROFOSAL: 10 PERCENT -
OF TEE ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE. DURING-THE CONTRACT TERM: $10,000: OR WHICHEVER
I5 LESS. THE BOND SEALL, BE CONDITICNED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WRICH MAY
BE ADJUDGED AGAINST THE CONTRACTOR FILING TEE PROTEST ACTICN. IN LIEU OF A
BOND, THE UNIVERSITY MAY ACCEPT A CASHIER'S CHECK OR MONEY ORDER IN THE AMOUNT

OF THE BCND. FAILURE TC FILE THE PROPER BOND AT THE TTME OF Fﬁ-ING THE FORMOL

PAGE: QF PROTEST, SHALT, RESULP IN » DENTAL OF THE FROTEST.
T : e i .
\ EIREE YT Tobe G
DESCRIPTION/VENDORS Dos. . Belt v m‘"‘ .5 LN .
AHng TTehos] PG ?“‘1‘&(%‘@'3?1‘“@ ost qfiw‘& Shoes | Conaestion
. - - = T —" . :
ITN COVER SIGNED ' @ ne | FED | wo | (¥ES w0y { (¥ES) | Mo s xo
ADDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED @ NO C{”‘“’“ES NO @ T No GES NO :*Q@;}‘ NO
ADDENDUM NO. 2 SIGNED (%85| wo | (FEsy| w0 | (EsD| wo [ (FESD| o YES Dl NO
. - ot . m‘.’. -
EEO SIGNED @5 wo [ wes/| wo f GEsD| wo [Cves)| wo |SEEED| wo
N | : E P T
W9 SIGNED (¥es) | - wo gEY v I yes? | wo I<TEE) | wo | (JES NO
MINORITY. VENDOR @ . | - P
ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (§44) | e By Mo g tER No ES RO ¥ES RO
PROPOSAL CONTENT &8> | xo KFED | wo { ¥ES wo f[(yes )t wo |Cxes”| o
# PROPOSAL COPIES | oiiond Boapnos 1.0.34@% eogies tetigind Henpies [ odg: MJ 4 sopies ;‘.s.«c%gmj A oo
NO BID YES NO YES | NO | YES NO YES | NO YES |  NO
‘ 1 LT & Lot +
DISQUALIFIZD (RZASON/S) ; ; b
. S — o ._ i . ._....Mj
PENED BY:__Mark Lillquist TABULATED BY: | 200 %&_&m&é@ VERIFIED BY: e

EMARKS:

CIRGLED PRICE INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD.

REV.8/712008




N TITLE: Gopiers, Printers and Multi-Functional Printers.

N NUMBER: 9-13-G

FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRUSCKIBED 1N SECLLUN
120.57(3) , FLORTDA STATUTES, CR FAILURE TC POST THE BOND OR OTHER
SECURITY REQUIRED BY LAW WITHIN THE TIME ALLOWED FCR FILING A BOND
SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEENINGS UNDER CEAPTER 120, FLORIDA

R STATUTES. ALL BIDS/BEROPOSALS ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SURJECY TC THE
PENiNG DATE 22 2009 TIME 300 P'M' STATE'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND ALL ADDITIONAL TERMS AND
CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY TEE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL EAVE
NO FORCE aND EFFECT. QFFIRS FROM THE VENDCORS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY
WARDED DATE OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE QPENING DATE AND TIME. ALL OTEER
_ OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TQ THIS SOLICITATICON, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY
OSTING TIME/DATE REJECTED &S LATE.
FROM: / | NOTTCE'OF BID/PROPOSALS PROTEST BONDING REQUFREMENT- ANY PERSON WEO FILES
’ AN ACTION PROTESTING A DECISION OR INTENDED DECISION PERTATINING TO A
. SOLICTITATION SHALL AT THE TIME OF FILING OF 'THE FORMAL PROTEST, POST
UNTIL: . / WITH THE UNIVERSTTY A BOND BAYRBLE 10 THE UNIVERSTTY OF SOUTH FLORIDA IN
AN AMOUHT BOUAL TO: 10 PERCENT OF THE ESTIMATED VALUE OF THE
g L)f HORING TH CONTRAGT FERGL: S10,000: OB WHLCHSVER 15 LeSG. TAD BOND SHALL
PAGE: OF PAGE(S) BE CONDITIONED UPON THE DAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED
AGRINST THE CONTRACTOR EXLING THE PROTHST ACTION. IN LIED OF A BOND, THE
UNIVERSITY MAY ACCE'D'I' A CASHIER'S CHECK CRMONEY ORDER IN THE aMOUNT OF
THE BOND. FAILURE 7O FILE TEE PROPER BOND AT THE TIMS OF FILING '.'EH:E} FORMBL
PROTEST , SHATLY. RESULT T 4 DENIAL CHF PEE PROTEST.
DESCRIPTION/VENDORS C@“‘"‘m Lomaese] PC Madt Gep, Wegf "—q-m_ s X&”"ﬁ b Qi {ffﬁ’*%
, srlekons opes, g e ¢
TN COVER SIGNED =Sy | no | FED | No [ vES @ YER) | wNo | TESH| wo
ADDENDUM NO: 1 SIGNED eS| o g5 | wo €Sy | wo - | (TS| no YES NO
ADDENDUM NO. 2 SIGNED ves | (o> | & | wo | ves [N ((TES) | wo | @ESD| wo |
EEO SIGNED EYE‘@ {oNo NO vEs | (TOy | (¥Es o | (FESY | wo J%
W9 STGNED Cyesyr | wo | @EED| wo (GES|.vo [(FEE?| wo | (IEED| wo |
MINORITY VENDOR vE3 NO ES NG YES NO» | CPES) | MO s> | o %
ENTERPRISE RESPONSE ($44) @ Qo> @ &
PROPOSAL CONTENT CYESD | No | AES>| wo | &gESN| No NO' | (¥ESY | WO
- " $ n . - . - i r v o . j .
¥ PROPOSAL COPIES b Bfesgnes |44 Copies | [+ eopies ||+ Y copes |1+ cofies
NO BID YES NO YRS NO YES NC YES NO § YES |- NO.
T ‘ i ’ LOTE ol |
DISQUALIFIED (REASON/S) _ { !@
PENED BY:__ Mark Lillguist TABULATED BY: &L 82400 i) A6 VERIFIED BY:

EMARKS:

CIRCLED PRICE INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD.

REV.8/7/2008




N TITLE: Copiers, Printers and Mulii-Functional Printers

N NUMBER: 9-13-G

FAILURE TO FILE & PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTICON 120.57(3),
FLORILA STATUIES, OR FRAILURE TO POST THE BOND CR OTHER SECURITY REQUIRED
BY AW WITHIN THE TIME ALLOWED FOR FILING A BOND SHALL CONSTITUTE A
WALVER OF FROCEEDINGS TNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES.
BIDSYPROPOUSALS ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TC THE STATE'S TERMS AND

RLL

. , CONDITION. . ] L TERMS €0)
PENING DATE: May 22, 2009 TIME __3:00 P.JA. ETDDERS/EROPCSERD ARE. R%JIQCJ?TDEDDI ﬁfﬁm PAVE HO Fzgigigﬂg ;%?Dogégﬁz
' FROM THE VENDORS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE
/ RECVE OPENING DATE AND TIME., ALL OTEER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO THIS
WARDED DATE SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE EEREBY REJECTED £S LATE.
DSTING TIME/DATE NORILE OF BID/PROPOSHLS PROTEST EONDING REQUIREMENT- ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN
] ACTION PROTESTING A DECISION OR INTENDED DECLSION BERTAINING TO A
FROM: i SOLICITATION SHALL AT THE TIME OF FILING CF TEEZ FORMAL PROTEST, POST WITH
TEE UNIVERSITY A BOND BANABLE TO THE UNIVERSTTY OF SOUTH FLORIDA IN AN
o . BMOUNT EQUAL TO: 10 PERCENT OF THE ESTIMATED VALUE OF THE PROTESTOR'S BID.
UNTIL: - OR PROPOSAL: 10 PERCENT OF THE ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE DURING THE CONTRACT
. TERM: $10,000: OR WHEICHEVER IS TRSS. THE BOND SHALL BE CONDITIONED URCN THEE .
5 «‘L}— DAYMENTY OF ALL COSTS WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST THE CONTRACTOR FILING.
. ‘ = THE PROTEST ACTION. IN LIEU OF A 2OND, TEE UNIVERSITY MAY ACCERT A
PAGE: O — PAGE(S) CASEIER'S CHECK OR MONEY ORDER IN TEE AMOUNT OF THE BOND. FAITURE T0 ETLE
’ . THE PROFER BCND AT THE TIME OF FILING THE FORMALL P’RO‘J.‘:_E_ST, SHATT, RESULT IN &
3 ’EW%N%M.‘OF'TE‘E PROTE YT,
DESCRIPTION/VENDORS SO(LP KD‘\“C-Q. 27’5&& -2-"—{\@ D!‘?‘ﬁ?ﬁm ﬂ...&\"&-i 1@:33&& ‘
A Mieohea, 'i‘_:xE:?i:S"\ Sk ons im‘ma‘mj Grovp
ITN COVER SIGNED EDH | wo | @ES| v [TED! w | & o gESy No
ADDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED EEs>| wo VES NO YES | vs | NO) &FES NO
ADDENDUM NO, 2 SIGNED vzs | (oo [{GES | wo ves | (RO | ves | (o) | @& | wo
EEC SIGNED | &> | wo | & wo [(Esy wo | GEsSD wo | &EF | w0
WO SIGNED TES NO . f CPEES | wo j (ES| wo @ vo |CEES| wo
MINORITY VENDOR @ “xo | o o | @ NO vEs Ol MO £S NO
ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (#44) - @ ‘ r:"‘ . (ibm.
PROPOSAL CONTENT NO @ vo | FED| W YES No  [“gEs )l o
# PROPOSAL COPIES . ]m—}@l + Y eopies {1 + L copies, |+ \ qu@; ] & Q@ﬁ}"»ﬂi& / *4&0@'&3
NO BID YES NO -¥YES © NO YES NG YRS NO YES NO
_ _ LT
DISQUALTIFIED (REASON/S) . :
PENED BY:_ Mark Lillquist TABULATED BY: L@Z@fﬁ» g::,e'g")ﬁ{ﬁH@‘ ¥ '

EMARKS:

CIRCLED PRICE INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD.

VERIFIED BY:;

REV.8/7/2008




TN PROPOSAL TABULATION

[N TITLE: Copiers. Printers and Muiti-Functional Printers
TN NUMBER: 213-G

FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITEIN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3),
FLORIDA STATUTES, OR FAILURE TO POST THE BOND OR OTHER SECURKTY REQUIRED
BY LAW WITHIN THE TIME ALLOWED FOR FILING A EOND SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER
CF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES. ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS
ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATETS TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY

AND ALL ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PRCPCSERS ARE
REJECTED AND SHALL HAVE NO FCRCE AND EFFECT. OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED

i . ‘ I . y HERETN BRE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THEE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND
)PENING DATE' Mav 22' 2009 TIME 3'00 P'M' TIME. ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESEONSZ TC TEIS SCOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE
i gEREBY REJECTED AS LATE. .
WARDED DATE NOTICE OF BID/PROPOSATS PROFEST BONDING REQUIREMENT- ANY PERSON WHO FYLES AN
ACTION PROTESTING A DECISION CR INTENDED DECLSION PERTAINING TO A SOLICITATION.
YOSTING TIME/DATE . SHALL AT THE TIME OF FILING OF THE FORMAL PROTEST, POST WITH THE. UNIVERSITY 2
s ' BOND PAYABLE TC TEE UNIVERSITY OF SOUTH FLORIDA IN AN BMOUNT EQUAL TO: 10
FROM [ PERCENT OF TEE ESTIMATED VALUE OF THE PROTESTCR'S BID OR PROPOSAL: 10 PERCENT -
' CE THE ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE DURING'THE CONTRACT TERM: $10,000: OR WHICHEVER
. I5 LESS. TEE BOND SHALL BE CONDITIONED UPCN THE PAYMENT OrF ALL COSTSE WHICH MAY
UNTR.; / SE ADJUDGED AGAIRST THE CONTRACTOR FILING THE PROTEST ACTICON. IN LIEU OF A
BOND, THE UNIVERSITY MRY ACCEPT A CRASHIER'S CHECK OR MONEY ORDER IN THE AMOUNT
’ L‘ J,r . O THE BOND. FAILURE T0 FILE THE PROFER BOND AT THE TIME OF FILING THE FORMML .
PAGE: i ' OF "‘"‘" PAGE(S} PROTEST, SEAIL RESULT IN A DENIAL OF THE PROTEST.
DESCRIPTION/VENDORS }C{?f O
_ITN COVER SIGNED @ NG NO YES No | ¥ES |, WO | vES NO
ADDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED || (FES>)| . WO o | ¥mEs | xo YES. | No | YES NO
ADDENDUM NO. 2 SIGNED || (¥ESD| NO NO YES NO YES NO | ¥ES | NO
EEO SIGNED (" ZES NO' NO YES |, NO YES | NO | YES NO
W9 SIGNED 1 E&EDH | w | NO YES NO YES NO YES NO
MINORTTY. VENDOR' S e | g
: NG NO YES NO ¢ YES NO YES NO
ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (#44) - ’ .
PROPOSAL CONTENT ' NO NO YES No | vms NO YES NO
# PROPOSAL COPIES | F Leppers
NO BID YES . NC- NG YES | NO | YES NO YES NO
‘ Lot L
DISQUALTFIED (REASON/ $) :
L ' !
JPENED BY:_ Mark Lillquist TABULATED BY: L&Zﬂ (3 :b:{‘h’}f ¥ éf” VERIFIED BY: -

REMARKS:  CIRCLED PRICE iNDICATES INTENT TQ AWARD

REV.8/7/2008
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- Ricoh Aficio




Proven Productivity
Staying competitive means doing more work in
less time with accuracy and reliability. Trust the
Ricoh Aficio MP C65015P/C7501SP to provide
exactly what demanding users need.

* Reduce turnaround time with fast output. The MP C6501SP delivers 60
color and 65 black & white pages per minute and the MP C75015p
achieves speeds up to 70 color and 75 black & white pages per minute,
Both offer duplexing at 100% of rated speed.

=+ Accelerate productivity with one-pass duplex scanning. This not only
reduces scan time, it minimizes wear and tear on sensitive originals.

» Navigate to the features you need in just a few quick selections.

The large full-color WVGA control panel is the same intuitive LCD
touch-screen available on all Ricoh MFPs, so you can upgrade the
fleet without retraining users.

* Meet tight deadlines and complete quick-turn jobs with one of the
shaortest warm-up times and fastest first copy times of any high-speed
color device in its class.

» Optimize efficiency with the ability to reload paper without interrupting
the current job. Total paper capacity with all options is an incredible
7,400 sheets.

High-End Finishing

Extend the possibilities of document production
with a variety of paper handling accessories and
professional-grade finishing options.

* Experiment with new formats. The Multi-Fold Unit offers six folding
options, including Half-Fold, Double Parallel Fold and Gate-Fold.

* Create full-color output on a wide range of paper grades. The system
accepts up to 140 lb. Index (253 g/m?) through the Paper Trays and up
to 110 Ib. Cover (300 g/m?) through the Bypass Tray.

* Improve uptime with the optional Large Capacity Tray. This 2,000-
sheet accessory holds paper sizes up to 12" x 18" and weights up
to 110 ib. Cover (300 o/m3).

* Distribute high-quality finished documents with stapling, hole punching,
ring binding or saddle-stitching, depending on your needs.

Reduce Operating Costs

In addition to its best-in-class affordability,
the Ricoh Aficio MP C6501SP/C7501SP delivers
the speed and versatility organizations need
to keep operating expenses low.

* Perform a wide variety of color and finishing tasks in-house, eliminating
the need to outsource complex jobs to expensive third-party providers.

* Consolidate jobs from multiple laser or inkjet printers to cut supply costs.

* Print marketing collateral, forms, training packets and other documents
on demand instead of managing large volumes of preprinted inventory,

* Empower creative teams to produce high-quality layouts, proofs and
rmack-ups with exceptional speed and quality.

* Improve workflow in copy shops and print-for-pay environments by
adding high-quality color capacity and finishing capabilities that are
ideal for quick-turn jobs.

Scan both sides of any original without feeding
it twice using single-pass duplex scanning.

Create a varigty of full-color documents with
different folding options.

Custle View
EmergiCare

Choose the Ring 8ind Unit to create ready-
to-distribute training packets, reports and
other lengthy docurments.




Enhance Performance and

Quality While Reducing Cost

Optional Cover Interposers
Feed pre-printed sheets from one or
two sources for front and back covers.

Gptional 3,000-Sheet Finishers
Choose from 50- or 100-sheet stapling
and 2- or 3-hole punching.

Optional 2,000-5heet Booklet Finisher
Fold and staple full-color documents to produce
finished bocklets and 2- or 3-hole punching.

50-Sheaet Finisher
This finisher lets you select multi-position
stapling for documents up to 50 pages,

Optional FD5000 Mult-Fold Unit
Execute severat different folds to create
a variety of finished documents.

Optional RB5000 Ring Bind Unit
Punch holes and insert plastic rings to
produce ready-to-distribute books.

BKS010e Boolklet Maker
Saddle stitch up to 30 sheets to create
120-page booklets.

GBC StreamPunch™ 1l
Create professional-quality bound books with
in-line punching in a variety of patterns,

Versatile Paper Sources

Standard paper sources include the Tandem 2 x 1,100-Sheet Paper Tray,

two 550-Sheet Paper Trays and Bypass Tray far a total of 3,400 sheets.

With additianal options also shown here, this system can hold up to 7,400 sheets.




Impressive Image Quality

The high-powered color print engine in the Ricoh
Aficio MP C65015P/C75015P creates high-resolution
images that capture your customers’ attention.

+ Maximize edge definition, coverage consistency and color density with
breakthrough PxP oil-free toner from Ricoh. Smaller particles and a lower
melting point combine to create smooth blends and solid fills.

« Help visually impaired users with a special printer driver function that adjusts
color levels to enhance readability.

Expect vivid, intense colors with a powerful 1200

@p’tl mize Color @utg}{jt dpi print engine and new PxP oil-free toner,
Configure the Ricoh Aficio MP C6501SP/C7501SP with
the Fiery E-7200 print controller for professional-
grade print and color control.

* Boost onboard power and expedite complex processing tasks with a
2.0GHz processor.

» Get all the advantages of Fiery color manipulation without giving up
familiar Ricoh functionality for other tasks. Even if you choose the optional
Fiery controller, you can keep user-friendly Ricoh menus for a full host
of scanning capabilities.

» Streamline workflow with convenient drag-and-drop functionality.
Just point and click to move files from the desktop to a print
queue, prepare files for output or balance workflow among multipfe
connected devices.

* Maximize job-to-job efficiency with the Command WorkStation
utility. Switch effortlessly from managing jobs to configuring the
controller’s settings.

» Bridge the gap betwsaen platforms, The Fiery controller provides
identical functionality in both Windows and Mac environments.

Expedite full-color job processing with the
incredibly fast, EFf Fiery E-7200 print controller.

Enhance Personal Productivity

The App2Me® solution revolutionizes document
management, enabling users to create customized
workflows and execute them anywhere they go.

« Bownload widgets to any client (desktop PC, laptop or Smartphone) and
use them on any Ricoh MFP enabled with App2Me.

* Enjoy maximum convenience and a consistent experience at each App2Me-
enabled MFF, which is completely personalized no matter where you go.

« Simplify complex workflows. Widgets can be created to combine,
distribute, edit and create documents, as well as perform many other
tasks automatically,

» Maximize productivity. App2Me improves efficiency through widgets
that control a virtually endless array of MFP, software or Web service-
driven workflows.

* Create specialized widgets for almost any need, in any framework
across multiple platforms that App2Me supports, such as Google Desklop™
and more.

With App2Me, you can download time-saving
and workflow-enhancing widgets and use
them at any Ricoh MFP enabled with the
App2Me solution.




Multifunction Performance
The Ricoh Aficio MiP C6501SP/C7501SP
integrates a diverse range of capabilities
into a relatively small footprint, enabling
you to reach new heights of productivity
and efficiency.

« Manage virtually any document-related task with this
incredibly versatile, high-speed system. Choose from
advanced printing, copying, faxing and scanning functions.

» Reduce network traffic with high-compression PDFs,
especialty when handling large full-color files.

Protect Every

Document
Advanced security features ™
ensure that sensitive documents
and the system itself remain
safe from multiple threats.

 Restrict systemn access to authorized users.
The system supports external (Windows, LDAP)
and internal (basic and user code} authentication.
* Protect business critical information with the
DataOverwriteSecurity System (DOSS) option.
It automatically overwrites the hard drive after
copy, scan, fax and print jobs, You can ako use
the HOD Encryption option to protect data, even
if the hard drive is removed or stolen.

Environmental Advantages
Many organizations are “going green” by
setting goals for sustainability. The Ricoh
Aficio MP C6501SP/C7501SP helps support
these efforts,

* Minimize total energy consumnption. The Ricoh Aficio
MP C6501SP/C75015P uses significantly less electricity
without compromising speed, productivity or functionality.
It is also designed to use less energy during sleep made.,

* Maintain outstanding image quality. With its lower melting
point, PxP toner requires less energy, yet delivers the high-
quality results you expect.

The Total
Green Office

Solution
Ricoh continues its long-standing
commitment to developing office
solutions with environmentally
friendly and superior energy- and
supply-saving features, without
compromising productivity.




General Specifications

Configuration
Scanning Efernent

Console

Pathed with movng 3dine CCD
array image-scanning

32068 {16068 x 2} {Shared)
Standard 150-Sheet ADF with
singte-pass color duplex scanning

System Memory
Document Feeder

Copy Resolution 600 dpt
Color/Grayscale 256 Levels
Quantity Indicator 1-9,999
Orginal Type Sheal/Book/Object
Criginal Size Upto 15" x 177
Warm-Up Time MP C65035P; <70 sec.
P CI5015: <60 gec,
First Copy Speed MP CE5015P: 5,7/7.5 sec. (BWITC)
MP C75G1SP; 4.9/6.4 sec. BWFC)
Output Speed MP C65015P: 60/65 (FC/BW)
MP C7501SP; 7075 (FLBW)
Standard Paper Capacity 1st Tray 1,300 x 2
550 sheels x 2nd & 3rd trays,
100-Sheet Bypass Tray
3,400 standard

7,400 sheet std. max capadty

557 %85 to 127 x (8"

14 1b. Bend - 80 b, Cover (216 o/md)
{Tray 1. 2}

14 [o. Bond - 140 fo. Index {253 o/m?)
(Trary 3}

17 b. Bond - 90 fb. Index {163 g/m?)
(Duplex}

14 o, Bordd - 110 . Cover {300 g/m?)
(Bypass}

7 reduction and 5 enfargement
25% to 400% in 1% increments
MP CH501SP: 120-127v/720A/60Hz
MNP C7501SP: 208-240V/20A/60Hz
29.5° X 33.5” x 48.4" (induding ADF)
<657 |bs,

Paper Size
Paper Weight

Magnification
Zoom
Power Requirements

Dimensions (WxDxH)
Weight

Copier Features;
Auto Paper Selection, Auto Reduce/Enlarge, Auto Start, Auto Tray
Switching, Auto Image Density, Duplex, User Codes, Stapling,
Cclor Frase/Conver, Hectronlc Sort, Image Retation, Rotate
Sorting, Series Copy, Doc Server, User Todls, Job Presets, Book/
SeriesfCombine, Insert Cover/SkpSheet, Chaptering, Tabs, Color/
Image Creation, Sample Copy, Energy Saver, Image Adjustment,
Muttiple Security Options

Printer Specifications {standard)

cPU Intel Pentiumn - M 1.4GHz
RAM 268 (STD/MAX)
HDD 326GB {160GB x 2) (Shared)

Standard Interfaces
Optional Interfacas

Ethernet (10/100BaseTX), USB2.G
Parallel, Wireless LAN
{IEEEB02.11a/g) Bluetooth,

Ethernel 1000 Base-7

TEPAP, iPX/SPX, Apple Tatk
Windows: 20000F/VistalServer
2003, Server 2008. Netvare; 3.12,
3.2, 4.1, 411, 5.0, 5.1, 6, 6.5, Unix,
Sun Solaris, HP-UX, SCO OpanServer,
RedHat Linux, 1BM A, MAC: 05 8.6
-9.2x, 0% X 10.1 or [ater

PCLSc, PCL6, XPS (standard),
Adobe PS3 foptional)

Up to 1200 dpi

Network Protocol
Operating Systems

Print Drivess

Max Print Resolution

Scanner Spedfications

Scanning Resolution Up to 600 dpi
Scan Area Upto 11" % 577
Scan Speed Simplex BAW 82 ipmyDuplex BAV 125

Tpm; Simplex Color 70 ipm/Duplex
Color 115 ipm

BW/Binary - TIFF MHMRB/MMR
Full Color/Grayscale: JPEG
10/100BaseTX, Wireless LAN

Compression

Standard Interfaces

www.ricoh-usa,com

Bringing Ricoh Value to Your Organization
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Scanner Features:

BW/FC Photo, BAW/FC Text, Auto Color, Auto Density, Image Rotation,
Kixed Size, SADF, Batch. Scan-to Modes Supposted: Scanto-Emad,
Seanto-Folder, Scan-to-URE, TWAIN Scanning, USB/SD2.0 Scarrto

Document Server Specifications (Standard)
Max. Stored Documents 3,000

#ax. Pages per Document 3,000

Max. Stored Pages 15,000

Fax Specifications {Optional)

Cirauit PSTHN, PBX

Compatibility ITU-T (CCITT) G3, Additional G3 opt.

Resolution 200 % 100/200 dpi (400 dpi w/opt.
SAF memary)

Compression Method MH, MR, MMR, JBIG

Scanning Speed 0.7 seC

Modem Speed 33.6 K - 2,400 bps

Transmission Speed G3: Approx 2 sec.

Memory Backup 1 hour

Quidk/Speed Dials 2,000 numbers

Group Dials 100 groups (560 per graup)

Energy Saver Standard

Accessories

RT4000 DLTACT

Paper Capacity 2,000 sheets

Paper Size upto 12" x 187

Paper Weight t4 1o, - $101b. Cover (300 g/m?)

Size 38.1" x 28" x 29.3"

Weight 192 Jbs.

RT43/LCT

Paper Capacity 4,000 sheels

Paper Size 85" x 11"

Paper Weight 14 Ib. - 34 Ib, Bond {128 g/md)

Size 127 x 187 x 26"

Wefght 44 |bs,

5391 9-Bin Mailhox

MNumber of Bins g

Stack Capacity of Bins 100 sheets

Paper $ize 557 x 85" -11"x17°

Paper Weight 14 b, - 34 lb. Bond (128 g/m?)

Size 21" x 24" x 267

Weight 33 lbs,

2 Source Cover Interposer

Paper Size 55" x85"-127x 18"

Paper Weight 17 fb. Boend - 110 ib, Index (159 g/m?)

Size 28" x 297 x 50"

Weight 93 [bs.

SR5000 100-Sheet Staple Finisher**

Capacity (Proof Tray) 500 sheets (8.57 x £17 or smalled)
250 sheets (8.5 x 147 or larger)

Paper Size 5.5"x85"-12"x 18"

Capacity (Shift Tray) 8.5 x 11" - 3,000 sheets
8.5 x 14" - 11 x 17" - 1,500 sheels
127 x 18" - 1,000 sheets

Paper Weight 14 . Bond - 11030, Cover (300 gir?)

Staple 857 x 117 - 100 pages
8.57x 147 - H{” x 17* - 50 pages

Size 31"x29"x39"

Weight 165 Ibs.

+45R5000 must indude Finsher Adapter Type €.
SR4030 50-Sheet Staple Finisher

Capacity (Proof Tray) 250 sheets (8.5% x 117 or smaler)
50 sheets (8.5" x 147 or larger}
Papar Size 55°x857-12"x 18
Capacity (Shift Tray} 8.5" x 117 - 3,000 sheets
B5Y x 147 - 11" x §77 « §,500 sheels
Paper Weight 14 b, Bond - 110 {b. Cover (300 g/n)
Staple 8.5 x 117 - 50 pagss
357 % 14* - 11" 2 17" - 30 pages
Size 26" x 24" x 38"
Weight 119 fbs,
SR4040 Booklet Maker
Capadity (Proof Tray) 250 sheets (85" x 117 or smaller)
50 sheets {8.5" x 14" or larger}
Paper Size 55°x8.5"- 127 x 18"
Capacity (Shift Tray) 857 x 117 - 2,000 sheets
B.5" X 14" - 11" x 17° - 1,000 sheets
Paper Weight 14 fb, Bond - 110 Ib. Cover (300 gfm?)
Staple 8.5" x 117 - 50 pages

85" x 147 - 117 x 177 - 30 pages

Rt

informatian

Saddle Stitch Staple*s* 857 x §17- 12" X 18" - |5 pages
Size 26" x 24" x 387
Weight 139 lbs,

*4+Panes Wweight for sadd'e stitch si2ping is 28 1b. Bond max

FD5000 Multi-Feiding Unit

Compatible with SR5000 and 584040 only.

Folding Type:

Single Sheet WMode: Z-Fold, Half-FofdfFrint inside, Half-Fold/Print
outside, Letter Fold-in#rint inside, Letter Fold-in/Print cutside,
Letter Fold-out, Double ParallelPrint inside, Double ParallelPrint
outside, Gate-Fo!d/Print inside, Gate-Fold/Print outside.

Multiple Sheets Afade: same a5 Single Sheet mode; up to 3 sheets.
Paper Size:

Single Sheet Mode: Z folding: 8.5% x 117 - 127 x 18%; Half folding:
85" x 117; Letter folding: 8.57 x 17 - 127 x 18", Double Parallel/
Gate folding: 857 x 117 - 12" x 187; Muftiple Sheets Made; Half
folding: 8.5” x 117 + 12 x 18"; Letter folding: 8.5" x 117; Double
Parallel/Gate folding: 857 x 117 - 12" x 187

GBC StreamPunch I

Paper Size 85" x 117 LEF

Paper Weight 20 fo. Bond - 110 1b. Index (216 g/nv}

Die Sets CombBind®, Twin Loop Wire (2:1 or
3:1), ColorCoil®, VeloBind®, Three-
Ring, ProClick®

BX5010e Production Booklet Maker

Paper Size 85711 117 2 17"

Paper Weight 16 Ta. Bond - 110 Ib. Index (216 gfm?)

Ring BInder RB5000

Paper Sizes Supported 8.57 x 117 (LEF only)

Max. Binding Capacity 100 sheets/booklet

Ring Sizes Supported 50-sheet/100-sheet

Paper Weight Punched 17 b. Bond - 80 fo Cover (216 g/m?)

Paper Weight Bound 17 Ib. Bond - 80 [b Cover {216 g/nr?)

Dimensions (WxDxH) 34.257 x 28.7" x 385"

Power Reguirements 110/115Y, S0/60Hz

Weight 319.6 Ibs.

Additional Accessories

Single Source Cover Interposer Type 3260; Punch Unit for SRS000;
Punch Unit for SR4038/4040; Jogger Oplion for 4030/4040; Legat
Tray for RT43 LCT Type 1675; 117 x 177 Tray Type 2105; Copy
Connector Kit Type 3260; Tab Sheat Unit Type 3260; Fife Format
Converter Type E; HDD Overwirite Security Kit Type H; HDD
Encryption Unit Type A; Copy Data Security Kit Type F; Adobe
PostSaipt3 Type C7501; [EEE802.11a/g Type J; IE£E1284 Tipe A;
Bluetooth Interface Unit Type 3245; Browser Unit Type E; G3
Interface Kit Type C7500; Key Counter Bracket Type 1027; Reader
Key Card Bracket Type B; Key Card IF Unit Type A; Gigabit Ethernet
Type B; Copy Tray Type 2075; FAX Memory Unit Type B 32MB,
USB2.0/50 Stot Type D

Fiery E-7200 Specifications

Controller Type Ernbedded Type

Fiery Platform Fiery E20

Maximum Continuaus MP CE5015P; 65 ppm BAY, 60 ppm color
Print Speed MP CT5015P: 75 ppm BAY, 70 ppm color

CPU Intel Core Duo T2500 2.0GHz

Host Interface 1000/100110BASE-T

Memory 1GR

Internal HDD 80GB

Operating System Linux

Network Protocel TCPAP (QPvdAPVE), AppleTalk (Auto

switching), SMB

Printer Description Language Adobe PosiSeript 3, PCLE/SC

Max Print Resolution Uip to 1200 dpi

Max Scan Resolution Up to 600 dpi

Fonts P53: 138 fonts/PCL: 80 AGFA fonts
Operation Panel On MfP

Utifities Standard: CormynandWorkStation 5,

Color Wise Pro Tools, Fiery Scan,
Printer Delete Utitity, Hery Yisb Tools
Ogptional; SeeQuence Impose, Color
Profiter Suite (UY version), Auto
Trapping, Spat-Cn, Hot Folders

1CC Profile, Color Chart, CMYK
Color Reference Pages, RGH Color
Tests, Trapping Support, ColorWise
Pro Toals

Color Cal, Pensitometer,
Speciraphotometer

Color Management Tools

Catibsation

For madrmun performance ard V'S, we recomsrend using genu'ne Ricoh
parts and supptes.
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